



Flight Schedule
Effective 13th February 2023 - 30th March 2024

www.pngair.com.pg

Origin	Destination	Departure Time	Arrival Time	Flight Time	Flight No	Aircraft Type	Routing	Days of Operations	Effective From	Effective To
Buka (BUA)	Kieta (KIE)	12:20	13:05	0:45	CG 8823	ATR	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	12:20	16:45	4:25	CG 8823	ATR	Via - KIE,RAB	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Rabaul (RAB)	12:20	13:50	2:00	CG 8823	ATR	Via - KIE	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
Daru (DAU)	Kiunga (UNG)	13:35	14:45	1:10	CG 8310	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	13:50	15:05	1:15	CG 1313	DH8	Non-Stop	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	16:55	18:05	1:10	CG 8311	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	17:00	18:15	1:15	CG 1306	DH8	Non-Stop	Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
Goroka (GKA)	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	16:25	16:55	0:30	CG 8548	ATR	Non-Stop	Tu,We,Th,Fr	30-Oct-22	12-Feb-23
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	16:25	16:55	0:30	CG 8548	ATR	Non-Stop	We,Th,Fr	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	9:45	11:00	1:15	CG 8561	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	9:45	11:00	1:15	CG 8561	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	9:55	11:10	1:15	CG 1561	DH8	Non-Stop	Mo	30-Oct-22	12-Feb-23
	Port Moresby (POM)	11:35	12:50	1:15	CG 8541	ATR	Non-Stop	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	11:35	12:50	1:15	CG 1561	DH8	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	17:25	18:40	1:15	CG 1563	DH8	Non-Stop	Tu	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
Gurney (GUR)	Misima (MIS)	7:45	8:45	1:00	CG 1642	DH8	Non-Stop	Tu,Th,Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	10:45	12:00	1:15	CG 1643	DH8	Non-Stop	Tu,Th,Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
Hoskins (HKN)	Lae (LAE)	9:35	11:00	1:25	CG 8721	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo,Tu,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	14:10	15:35	1:25	CG 8723	ATR	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	14:10	15:35	1:25	CG 1723	DH8	Non-Stop	We	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	15:30	16:55	1:25	CG 1721	DH8	Non-Stop	Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	15:45	17:10	1:25	CG 8721	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	9:35	12:40	3:05	CG 8721	ATR	Via - LAE	Mo,Tu,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	14:10	17:15	3:05	CG 8723	ATR	Via - LAE	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	14:10	17:15	3:05	CG 1723	DH8	Via - LAE	We	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	15:30	18:35	3:05	CG 1721	DH8	Via - LAE	Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	15:45	18:50	3:05	CG 8721	ATR	Via - LAE	Sa,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
Kavieng (KVG)	Rabaul (RAB)	11:20	12:15	0:55	CG 8722	ATR	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Rabaul (RAB)	12:55	13:50	0:55	CG 8720	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo,Tu,We,Th,Sa,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lihir (LNV)	12:45	13:25	0:40	CG 8926	ATR	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
Kieta (KIE)	Lihir (LNV)	15:45	16:25	0:40	CG 8925	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo,Tu,We,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Rabaul (RAB)	6:40	7:35	0:55	CG 8924	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo,Tu,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Rabaul (RAB)	13:35	13:50	1:15	CG 8823	ATR	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
Kiunga (UNG)	Port Moresby (POM)	13:35	16:45	3:10	CG 8823	ATR	Via - RAB	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Daru (DAU)	12:10	13:20	1:10	CG 1313	DH8	Non-Stop	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Daru (DAU)	15:15	16:25	1:10	CG 8311	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Daru (DAU)	15:20	16:30	1:10	CG 1306	DH8	Non-Stop	Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	11:10	12:20	1:10	CG 8409	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo	30-Oct-22	12-Feb-23
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	12:10	13:20	1:10	CG 1409	DH8	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	15:25	16:35	1:10	CG 8409	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	11:10	14:25	3:15	CG 8409	ATR	Via - HGU	Mo	30-Oct-22	12-Feb-23
	Port Moresby (POM)	12:10	15:05	2:55	CG 1313	DH8	Via - DAU	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	12:10	15:25	3:15	CG 1409	DH8	Via - HGU	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
Lae (LAE)	Port Moresby (POM)	15:15	18:05	2:50	CG 8311	ATR	Via - DAU	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	15:20	18:15	2:55	CG 1306	DH8	Via - DAU	Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	15:25	18:40	3:15	CG 8409	ATR	Via - HGU	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Hoskins (HKN)	9:25	10:50	1:25	CG 8722	ATR	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Hoskins (HKN)	11:00	12:25	1:25	CG 8720	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo,Tu,We,Th,Sa,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Madang (MAG)	11:40	12:35	0:55	CG 1602	DH8	Non-Stop	Mo,Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	7:50	9:00	1:10	CG 1501	DH8	Non-Stop	Fr,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	11:30	12:40	1:10	CG 8721	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo,Tu,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	13:40	14:50	1:10	CG 1503	DH8	Non-Stop	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	15:10	16:20	1:10	CG 8505	ATR	Non-Stop	Tu,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	15:40	16:50	1:10	CG 8507	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	15:40	16:50	1:10	CG 1507	DH8	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	16:05	17:15	1:10	CG 8723	ATR	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	16:05	17:15	1:10	CG 1723	DH8	Non-Stop	We	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	16:20	17:30	1:10	CG 1725	DH8	Non-Stop	Tu	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	16:55	18:05	1:10	CG 8503	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa	01-Apr-23	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	17:25	18:35	1:10	CG 1721	DH8	Non-Stop	Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	17:30	18:40	1:10	CG 1603	DH8	Non-Stop	Mo,Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	17:40	18:50	1:10	CG 8721	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	17:45	18:55	1:10	CG 1507	DH8	Non-Stop	We	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
Rabaul (RAB)	9:10	11:00	1:50	CG 1724	DH8	Non-Stop	We	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24	
Rabaul (RAB)	9:25	12:15	2:50	CG 8722	ATR	Via - HKN	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24	
Rabaul (RAB)	9:40	11:30	1:50	CG 1724	DH8	Non-Stop	Tu,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24	
Rabaul (RAB)	11:00	13:50	2:50	CG 8720	ATR	Via - HKN	Mo,Tu,We,Th,Sa,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24	
Wewak (WWK)	11:40	14:05	2:25	CG 1602	DH8	Via - MAG	Mo,Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24	

Origin	Destination	Departure Time	Arrival Time	Flight Time	Flight No	Aircraft Type	Routing	Days of Operations	Effective From	Effective To
Lihir (LNV)	Kavieng (KVG)	5:30	6:10	0:40	CG 8924	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo,Tu,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	5:20	8:35	3:15	CG 8913	ATR	Via - RAB	We	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	9:45	13:00	3:15	CG 8911	ATR	Via - RAB	Tu,We,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	10:30	13:45	3:15	CG 8911	ATR	Via - RAB	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	10:50	13:00	2:10	CG 8903	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Rabaul (RAB)	5:20	5:55	0:35	CG 8913	ATR	Non-Stop	We	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Rabaul (RAB)	5:30	7:35	2:05	CG 8924	ATR	Via - KVG	Mo,Tu,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Rabaul (RAB)	8:20	8:55	0:35	CG 8915	ATR	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Rabaul (RAB)	9:45	10:20	0:35	CG 8911	ATR	Non-Stop	Tu,We,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Rabaul (RAB)	10:30	11:05	0:35	CG 8911	ATR	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
Rabaul (RAB)	13:55	14:30	0:35	CG 8919	ATR	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24	
Madang (MAG)	Lae (LAE)	16:05	17:00	0:55	CG 1603	DH8	Non-Stop	Mo,Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	14:20	15:50	1:30	CG 1629	DH8	Non-Stop	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	16:05	18:40	2:35	CG 1603	DH8	Via - LAE	Mo,Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Vanimo (VAI)	8:30	10:55	2:25	CG 1628	DH8	Via - WWK	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Wewak (WWK)	8:30	9:30	1:00	CG 1628	DH8	Non-Stop	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
Wewak (WWK)	13:05	14:05	1:00	CG 1602	DH8	Non-Stop	Mo,Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24	
Misima (MIS)	Gurney (GUR)	9:15	10:15	1:00	CG 1643	DH8	Non-Stop	Tu,Th,Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	9:15	12:00	2:45	CG 1643	DH8	Via - GUR	Tu,Th,Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
Moro (MXH)	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	9:20	10:00	0:40	CG 8540	ATR	Non-Stop	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	12:45	14:20	1:35	CG 8559	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
Mt. Hagen (HGU)	Goroka (GKA)	10:35	11:05	0:30	CG 8541	ATR	Non-Stop	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Kiunga (UNG)	9:35	11:40	2:05	CG 1406	DH8	Via - TBG	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Kiunga (UNG)	9:35	10:40	1:05	CG 8408	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo	30-Oct-22	12-Feb-23
	Kiunga (UNG)	13:45	14:55	1:10	CG 8408	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Moro (MXH)	11:35	12:15	0:40	CG 8559	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	10:35	12:50	2:15	CG 8541	ATR	Via - GKA	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	11:15	12:50	1:35	CG 8495	ATR	Non-Stop	Tu,Th,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	11:25	13:00	1:35	CG 8583	ATR	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	11:35	14:20	2:45	CG 8559	ATR	Via - MXH	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	12:35	14:10	1:35	CG 8623	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	12:50	14:25	1:35	CG 8409	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo	30-Oct-22	12-Feb-23
	Port Moresby (POM)	13:50	15:25	1:35	CG 1409	DH8	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	13:55	15:30	1:35	CG 1543	DH8	Non-Stop	Mo	30-Oct-22	12-Feb-23
	Port Moresby (POM)	16:25	18:00	1:35	CG 1625	DH8	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	17:05	18:40	1:35	CG 8409	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	17:05	18:40	1:35	CG 8545	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo,Sa	30-Oct-22	12-Feb-23
	Port Moresby (POM)	17:05	18:40	1:35	CG 8545	ATR	Non-Stop	Tu	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	17:25	19:00	1:35	CG 1545	DH8	Non-Stop	Sa	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	17:25	19:00	1:35	CG 8549	ATR	Non-Stop	Tu,We,Th,Fr	30-Oct-22	12-Feb-23
	Port Moresby (POM)	17:25	19:00	1:35	CG 8549	ATR	Non-Stop	We,Th,Fr	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Tabubil (TBG)	9:35	10:45	1:10	CG 1404	DH8	Non-Stop	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Tabubil (TBG)	9:35	10:45	1:10	CG 1406	DH8	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Vanimo (VAI)	10:35	13:00	2:25	CG 1624	DH8	Via - WWK	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Wewak (WWK)	9:35	10:35	1:00	CG 8622	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
Wewak (WWK)	10:35	11:35	1:00	CG 1624	DH8	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24	
Popondetta (PNP)	Port Moresby (POM)	13:55	14:40	0:45	CG 1677	DH8	Non-Stop	Tu, Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Buka (BUA)	7:00	11:40	3:10	CG 8820	ATR	Via - RAB	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Daru (DAU)	11:40	13:05	1:25	CG 8310	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Daru (DAU)	12:40	16:30	3:50	CG 1306	DH8	Via - UNG	Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Goroka (GKA)	7:50	9:15	1:25	CG 8560	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Goroka (GKA)	7:50	9:15	1:25	CG 8560	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Goroka (GKA)	8:00	9:25	1:25	CG 1560	DH8	Non-Stop	Mo	30-Oct-22	12-Feb-23
	Goroka (GKA)	9:40	11:05	1:25	CG 1560	DH8	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Goroka (GKA)	14:30	15:55	1:25	CG 8548	ATR	Non-Stop	Tu,We,Th,Fr	30-Oct-22	12-Feb-23
	Goroka (GKA)	14:30	15:55	1:25	CG 8548	ATR	Non-Stop	We,Th,Fr	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Goroka (GKA)	15:30	16:55	1:25	CG 1562	DH8	Non-Stop	Tu	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Goroka (GKA)	15:30	16:55	1:25	CG 1562	DH8	Non-Stop	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Gurney (GUR)	6:00	7:15	1:15	CG 1642	DH8	Non-Stop	Tu,Th,sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Hoskins (HKN)	7:45	10:50	3:05	CG 8722	ATR	Via - LAE	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Hoskins (HKN)	9:20	12:25	3:05	CG 8720	ATR	Via - LAE	Mo,Tu,We,Th,Sa,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Kavieng (KVG)	8:35	12:15	3:40	CG 8926	ATR	Via - RAB	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Kiunga (UNG)	7:30	11:40	4:10	CG 1406	DH8	VIA - HGU,TBG	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Kiunga (UNG)	7:30	10:40	3:10	CG 8408	ATR	Via - HGU	Mo	30-Oct-22	12-Feb-23
	Kiunga (UNG)	11:40	14:55	3:15	CG 8408	ATR	Via - HGU	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Kiunga (UNG)	11:40	14:45	3:05	CG 8310	ATR	Via - DAU	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Kiunga (UNG)	12:40	14:50	2:10	CG 1306	DH8	Non-Stop	Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	6:10	7:20	1:10	CG 1500	DH8	Non-Stop	Fr,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	7:30	8:40	1:10	CG 1724	DH8	Non-Stop	We	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	7:45	8:55	1:10	CG 8722	ATR	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	8:00	9:10	1:10	CG 1724	DH8	Non-Stop	Tu, Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	9:20	10:30	1:10	CG 8720	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo,Tu,We,Th,Sa,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	10:00	11:10	1:10	CG 1602	DH8	Non-Stop	Mo,Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	12:00	13:10	1:10	CG 1502	DH8	Non-Stop	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	13:30	14:40	1:10	CG 8504	ATR	Non-Stop	Tu,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24

Origin	Destination	Departure Time	Arrival Time	Flight Time	Flight No	Aircraft Type	Routing	Days of Operation	Effective From	Effective To
Port Moresby (POM)	Lae (LAE)	14:00	15:10	1:10	CG 1506	DH8	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	14:00	15:10	1:10	CG 8506	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	15:15	16:25	1:10	CG 8502	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa	01-Apr-23	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	16:05	17:15	1:10	CG 1506	DH8	Non-Stop	We	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lihir (LNV)	6:00	9:15	3:15	CG 8910	ATR	VIA - RAB	Tu,We,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lihir (LNV)	8:00	10:20	2:20	CG 8902	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lihir (LNV)	8:35	13:25	4:50	CG 8926	ATR	VIA - RAB,KVG	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Madang (MAG)	6:30	8:00	1:30	CG 1628	DH8	Non-Stop	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Madang (MAG)	10:00	12:35	2:35	CG 1602	DH8	Via - LAE	Mo,Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Misima (MIS)	6:00	8:45	2:45	CG 1642	DH8	Via - GUR	Tu,Th,sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Moro (MXH)	7:15	8:50	1:35	CG 8540	ATR	Non-Stop	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	7:15	10:00	2:45	CG 8540	ATR	Via - MXH	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	7:30	9:05	1:35	CG 1404	DH8	Non-Stop	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	7:30	9:05	1:35	CG 1406	DH8	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	7:30	9:05	1:35	CG 8622	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	7:30	9:05	1:35	CG 8408	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo	30-Oct-22	12-Feb-23
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	8:30	10:05	1:35	CG 1624	DH8	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	9:30	11:05	1:35	CG 8540	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	11:40	13:15	1:35	CG 8408	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	11:50	13:25	1:35	CG 1542	DH8	Non-Stop	Mo	30-Oct-22	12-Feb-23
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	14:30	16:55	2:25	CG 8548	ATR	Via - GKA	Tu,We,Th,Fr	30-Oct-22	12-Feb-23
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	14:30	16:55	2:25	CG 8548	ATR	Via - GKA	We,Th,Fr	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	15:00	16:35	1:35	CG 8544	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo,Sa	30-Oct-22	12-Feb-23
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	15:00	16:35	1:35	CG 8544	ATR	Non-Stop	Tu	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	15:20	16:55	1:35	CG 1544	DH8	Non-Stop	Sa	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Popondetta (PNP)	12:40	13:25	0:45	CG 1676	DH8	Non-Stop	Tu,Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Rabaul (RAB)	6:00	8:10	2:10	CG 8910	ATR	Non-Stop	Tu,We,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Rabaul (RAB)	7:00	9:10	2:10	CG 8820	ATR	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Rabaul (RAB)	7:30	11:00	3:30	CG 1724	DH8	Via - LAE	We	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Rabaul (RAB)	7:45	12:15	4:30	CG 8722	ATR	Via - LAE,HKN	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Rabaul (RAB)	8:00	11:30	3:30	CG 1724	DH8	Via - LAE	Tu,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Rabaul (RAB)	8:35	10:45	2:10	CG 8926	ATR	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Rabaul (RAB)	9:20	13:50	4:30	CG 8720	ATR	Via - LAE,HKN	Mo,Tu,We,Th,Sa,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Tabubil (TBG)	7:30	10:45	3:15	CG 1404	DH8	Via - HGU	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Tabubil (TBG)	7:30	10:45	3:15	CG 1406	DH8	Via - HGU	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Tari (TIZ)	7:05	8:50	1:45	CG 8490	ATR	Non-Stop	Tu,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Tari (TIZ)	8:00	9:45	1:45	CG 8582	ATR	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Vanimo (VAI)	6:30	10:55	4:25	CG 1628	DH8	Via - MAG,WWK	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Vanimo (VAI)	8:30	13:00	4:30	CG 1624	DH8	Via - HGU,WWK	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Wapenamanda (WBM)	7:05	9:50	2:45	CG 8490	ATR	Via - TIZ	Tu,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Wapenamanda (WBM)	8:10	9:50	1:40	CG 8490	ATR	Non-Stop	Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Wewak (WWK)	6:30	9:30	3:00	CG 1628	DH8	Via - MAG	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Wewak (WWK)	7:30	10:35	3:05	CG 8622	ATR	Via - HGU	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Wewak (WWK)	8:30	11:35	3:05	CG 1624	DH8	Via - HGU	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Wewak (WWK)	10:00	14:05	4:05	CG 1602	DH8	Via - LAE,MAG	Mo,Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
Rabaul (RAB)	Buka (BUA)	9:40	11:40	1:00	CG 8820	ATR	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Hoskins (HKN)	8:05	9:05	1:00	CG 8721	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo,Tu,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Hoskins (HKN)	12:45	13:40	0:55	CG 8723	ATR	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Hoskins (HKN)	12:45	13:40	0:55	CG 1723	DH8	Non-Stop	We	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Hoskins (HKN)	14:00	15:00	1:00	CG 1721	DH8	Non-Stop	Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Hoskins (HKN)	14:20	15:15	0:55	CG 8721	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Kavieng (KVG)	11:15	12:15	1:00	CG 8926	ATR	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Kavieng (KVG)	14:20	15:15	0:55	CG 8925	ATR	Non-Stop	Mo,Tu,We,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	8:05	11:00	2:55	CG 8721	ATR	Via - HKN	Mo,Tu,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	12:45	15:35	2:50	CG 8723	ATR	Via - HKN	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	12:45	15:35	2:50	CG 1723	DH8	Via - HKN	We	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	14:00	15:50	1:50	CG 1725	DH8	Non-Stop	Tu	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	14:00	16:55	2:55	CG 1721	DH8	Via - HKN	Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	14:20	17:10	2:50	CG 8721	ATR	Via - HKN	Sa,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lihir (LNV)	8:40	9:15	0:35	CG 8910	ATR	Non-Stop	Tu,We,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lihir (LNV)	9:25	10:00	0:35	CG 8916	ATR	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lihir (LNV)	11:15	13:25	2:10	CG 8926	ATR	Via - KVG	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lihir (LNV)	14:20	16:25	2:05	CG 8925	ATR	Via - KVG	Mo,Tu,We,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lihir (LNV)	15:00	15:35	0:35	CG 8920	ATR	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	6:25	8:35	2:10	CG 8913	ATR	Non-Stop	We	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	8:05	12:40	4:35	CG 8721	ATR	Via - HKN,LAE	Mo,Tu,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	10:50	13:00	2:10	CG 8911	ATR	Non-Stop	Tu,We,Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	11:35	13:45	2:10	CG 8911	ATR	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	12:45	17:15	4:30	CG 8723	ATR	Via - HKN,LAE	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	12:45	17:15	4:30	CG 1723	DH8	Via - HKN,LAE	We	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	14:00	17:30	3:30	CG 1725	DH8	Via - LAE	Tu	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	14:00	18:35	4:35	CG 1721	DH8	Via - HKN,LAE	Th	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	14:20	18:50	4:30	CG 8721	ATR	Via - HKN,LAE	Sa,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	14:35	16:45	2:10	CG 8823	ATR	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
Tabubil (TBG)	Daru (DAU)	11:15	13:20	2:05	CG 1313	DH8	Via - UNG	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Kiunga (UNG)	11:15	11:40	0:25	CG 1406	DH8	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Kiunga (UNG)	11:15	11:40	0:25	CG 1313	DH8	Non-Stop	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	11:15	15:05	3:50	CG 1313	DH8	UNG,DAU	Mo	13-Feb-23	30-Mar-24
Tari (TIZ)	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	10:15	10:55	0:40	CG 8583	ATR	Non-Stop	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	10:15	13:00	2:45	CG 8583	ATR	Via - HGU	Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Wapenamanda (WBM)	9:20	9:50	0:30	CG 8490	ATR	Non-Stop	Tu,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24

Origin	Destination	Departure Time	Arrival Time	Flight Time	Flight No	Aircraft Type	Routing	Days of Operations	Effective From	Effective To
Vanimo (VAI)	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	13:30	15:55	2:25	CG 1625	DH8	Via - WWK	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Madang (MAG)	11:25	13:50	2:25	CG 1629	DH8	Via - WWK	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	11:25	15:50	4:25	CG 1629	DH8	Via - WWK,MAG	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	13:30	18:00	4:30	CG 1625	DH8	Via - WWK,HGU	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Wewak (WWK)	11:25	12:20	0:55	CG 1629	DH8	Non-Stop	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Wewak (WWK)	13:30	14:25	0:55	CG 1625	DH8	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
Wapenamanda (WBM)	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	10:20	10:45	0:25	CG 8495	ATR	Non-Stop	Tu,Th,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	10:20	12:50	2:30	CG 8495	ATR	Via - HGU	Tu,Th,Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
Wewak (WWK)	Madang (MAG)	12:50	13:50	1:00	CG 1629	DH8	Non-Stop	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Madang (MAG)	14:35	15:35	1:00	CG 1603	DH8	Non-Stop	Mo,Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	11:05	12:05	1:00	CG 8623	ATR	Non-Stop	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Mt. Hagen (HGU)	14:55	15:55	1:00	CG 1625	DH8	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Lae (LAE)	14:35	17:00	2:25	CG 1603	DH8	Via - MAG	Mo,Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	11:05	14:10	3:05	CG 8623	ATR	Via - HGU	Sa	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	12:50	15:50	3:00	CG 1629	DH8	Via - MAG	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	14:35	18:40	4:05	CG 1603	DH8	Via - MAG,LAE	Mo,Fr	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Port Moresby (POM)	14:55	18:00	3:05	CG 1625	DH8	Via - HGU	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24
	Vanimo (VAI)	10:00	10:55	0:55	CG 1628	DH8	Non-Stop	We	28-Dec-22	30-Mar-24
	Vanimo (VAI)	12:05	13:00	0:55	CG 1624	DH8	Non-Stop	Su	30-Oct-22	30-Mar-24